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An On-the-Job Construction Administration Resource for Architects

Co-written by an architect and an attorney, this is the ideal desktop guide for architects, engineers, and other
design professionals in need of expert advice on navigating the construction process and anticipating,
avoiding, and managing liability risks. This invaluable construction administration resource leads you, step-
by-step, through a typical project--from contract to closeout.

Construction Administration for Architects provides tested techniques for proactively minimizing potential
construction problems, and responding strategically when unforeseen events occur. Covering private and
public sector work, this comprehensive handbook contains essential information for emerging professionals
as well as in-depth strategies for experienced industry veterans. Useful tips, checklists, and real-world
examples are included throughout the book.

Construction Administration for Architects covers:

Agreements and contracts●

Construction document details, such as specifications, drawing notes, project scope, credits, and cost●

estimates
Requests for proposal, bidding, and construction contract negotiation●

Field testing, inspection, and certification of work●

Documents management, including requests for substitution, requests for information, submittals, and●

applications for payment
Problems and disputes, such as poor workmanship, hidden conditions, and change order requests●

Contract closeout details, including schedule claims, retainage, and liens●

Post-construction warranty work and records retention●

Managing and limiting liability risk●
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From reader reviews:

Andria Miguel:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As you may know
that book is very important for people. The book Construction Administration for Architects had been
making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter
what advantages for you. The e-book Construction Administration for Architects is not only giving you more
new information but also being your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your current spend
time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with all the book Construction Administration for
Architects. You never really feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Joann Huertas:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice through
surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the item for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a publication your ability to survive enhance then having chance to endure than other is
high. For yourself who want to start reading any book, we give you this particular Construction
Administration for Architects book as basic and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than
just a book.

Lila Johnson:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or details even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of
you maybe will certainly update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you but the problems
coming to a person is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Construction Administration for
Architects is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what
you want and need in this era.

Samantha Bond:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Construction Administration for Architects
was colorful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Construction Administration
for Architects has many kinds or style. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Private
investigator Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are
generally make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for
you personally and try to like reading that will.
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